WL o o TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

d ShT
CThe Gazette of India

STHTEUT
EXTRAORDINARY
AW II—WEUE 3—37-WUS (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
IR | WehTivTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 370] 2 faoell, Jha, S8 18, 2014/3MM9TE 27, 1936
No. 370] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JULY 18, 2014/ASHADHA 27, 1936

T AR IREAR FAT0 WA

EIEGCE]
S faeetl, 18 TS, 2014
qr.#1.fA. 508(s1)—Fr=1T TIHE, G AT X q9a Atai+=a49, 2006 (2006 FT 34) F &1 91
FTT Y&d ATTRAT T TN H2d gU, FTT AT ¥ q1eah =49, 2011 F7 FMET FIA % (o0 Fefoteg qam
FATAT 8 —
1. (1) =9 H==T &7 "ier 918 Qrer et S 719 (Ferred) Fam, 2014 7 |
(2) T TSI  TRT9 6T TG AT T 2T |
2. T AT A 7 =99, 2011 § = —
(F) Fw 2.1.2, F 3u-79 1 & oigar & g9y ®, 9 (jii) F SU-ET (@) ¥ 9kl “UF a9 F T 9 g T
9Tsq TG STU ;
(@) 7w 2.1.3, % Su-F99 3 ® sfgar & 9y #, T E H qeal I W F T U I qu” 9058 W
ST |

[T. &. 1(29) 2011/zR=mon/us: ud s T g
SEOT FHT TUET, AT A= g

feoqur - o =W WA F TS, SETEer, 9L, @ 3, SU-ET (i) § AraLE. '@ 362(3), e
5%, 2011 G THRITAT TR T30 91 ST AT o707 T |elTed qgl A 17 8 |

2938 Gl1/2014 (H



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

MINISTRY OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 18th July, 2014

G.S.R. 508(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 91 of Food Safety and Standards Act, 2006 (34
of 2006), the Central Government hereby makes the following Rules amending the Food Safety and Standards Rules,
2011:—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Food Safety and Standards (Amendment) Rules, 2014.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Food Safety and Standards Rules, 2011,—

(a) in rule 2.1.2, in sub-rule 1 relating to Qualification, in clause (iii), in sub- clause (b), for the words “one year”, the
words “five years” shall be substituted;

(b) in rule 2.1.3, in sub-rule 3 relating to Qualification, in the proviso, for the words “two years”, the words “five years”
shall be substituted.

[F. No. 1(29) 2011/Haryana/FSSAI]
ARUN KUMAR PANDA, Addl. Secy.

Note :—The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide
number G.S.R 362(E), dated Sth, May, 2011 and these have not been amended so far.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



